

Wilson Fire Station Roof Replacement

BID OPENING

October 2, 2024 - 10:00 A.M.

Company Name	Lump Sum Proposal Base Bid	Add Alternate # 1 Heating Coil with 24" Roof Overhang	Add Alternate # 2 Replace all Wood Fascia	Add Alternate # 3 Replace all gutters and downspouts	Unit Pricing Item #1 Spot plywood decking (in kind) replacement	Addendum #1	Addendum #2	List of Subcontractor	Non-Collusion	Bid Security	Signed by an Officer of the
Young Developer LLC	\$78,500.00	\$3,600.00	\$12,400.00	\$1,600.00	\$6.30/sq ft	X	X	X	Not Included	X	X
RSR Residential (Bid Not Valid – Improperly Submitted)	\$108,232.00	\$3,175.00	Not Valid	Not Valid	Not included	X	X	X	X	X	X
Guaranteed Roofing	\$152,169.00	\$16,584.00	\$55,188.00	\$28,696.50	\$4.00/sq ft	X	X	X	X	Not Included	X
Eagle Rivet	\$149,105.00	\$5,500.00	\$22,090.00	\$18,625.00	\$10.00/sq ft	X	X	X	X	X	X
A1 Home Improvements	\$111,988.25	\$5,191.10	\$14,117.40	\$7,314.22	\$3.75/sq ft	X	X	X	X	X	X
AVT Construction	NO BID										
Silktown Roofing	NO BID										
4 You Home Improvement	NO BID										
Atlantic Restoration	NO BID										

Recorded By: **Julie Wilson**

Witnessed By: **Gary Dowgewicz**